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The way Americans get their news and information is changing. 
Newspaper newsrooms are approximately 30% smaller than in 
2000, network news suffered its sixth consecutive year of declines in 
viewership, and for the first time in 12 years, the audience for cable 
news fell substantially [1].  As these declines occur, web-based news 
reading and information gathering has significantly increased. 
According to 2011 data from the Pew Internet and American Life 
Project [2], roughly 78% of American adults are now using the internet, 
up from 14% in 1995. Of these, 76% say they use the internet to read the 
news, and 83% to search for health and medical-related information.

Despite overall increases in internet use, there are still those that lag 
behind in adoption, namely non-Hispanic blacks and those with lower 
income and educational attainment [2]. While some reports suggest 
that this so-called ‘digital divide’ may be narrowing over time with the 
increasing adoption of mobile devices and access to broadband [3,4], 
others have suggested otherwise [5,6]. Even if all groups were assured 
equal access to technology, the ability to derive equal benefit from its 
resources may still persist. 

This has particular implications for health. The internet is flooded 
with health- and medical-related news and information, some from 
reputable sources and others not.  So while the internet has the 
potential to serve as a valuable health-related resource, it may also 
promote false beliefs, encourage use of non-approved products or 
services, or foster suspicion of the medical establishment and currently 
accepted clinical guidelines and practices. Those who benefit from 
health-related resources on the internet are arguably those with the 
skills and knowledge to not only access the most reputable news and 
information sources, but also navigate through sometimes complicated 
web pages, comprehend the language and terminology, and understand 
and have the ability to follow through on suggested recommendations. 
Dr.VishViswanath from the Harvard School of Public Health refers to 
these as communication inequalities, and along with colleagues has 
developed The Structural Influence Model of Health Communication 
to delineate their effect on health [7]. The model theorizes that 
communication is a critical thread that links social factors such as race/
ethnicity and socioeconomic status to health outcomes. Given that 
communications plays a central role in promoting healthy behaviors 
[8-10], inequalities in communication among different subgroups, 
such as differential access to and use of information channels, attention 
to health content, and comprehension and capacity to act on relevant 
information, may result in differential prevention and treatment 
outcomes [7]. 

While it has been shown that the majority of Americans receive 
information, care, or support from a health professional offline [11], 
online news and information is quickly becoming an important 
supplement. It is here that minority and vulnerable populations, 
particularly those of lower education and lower literacy, have a clear 
disadvantage. Individuals searching for health information online are 

roughly five times more likely to have a college degree than less than a 
high school degree, and more than two times more likely to be earning 
$75,000 or more per year as opposed to less than $20,000 per year. 
They are also 30% less likely to be black as opposed to white [12]. Even 
those who do use the internet for health-related information suffer 
a disadvantage as popular health websites such as WedMD.com and 
Breastcancer.org are written at a 13thand 12thgrade level, respectively, 
and the National Institutes of Health’s website is written at the 9th grade 
level [13]. A qualitative study with low literacy and culturally diverse 
parents found that some actually intentionally avoided .edu or .gov 
websites because such websites were viewed as too complex [14]. 

When new information is delivered indiscriminately via the 
mass media, it is acquired at a faster rate among those of higher 
socioeconomic status [15]. Our understanding of the mechanisms 
underlying this process, however, is limited. Given that the wealth gap 
between white and non-white is widening, with the median wealth of 
white households now 20 times that of non-Hispanic black households 
and 18 times that of Hispanic households [16], research is needed to 
examine the processes which give rise to communication equalities. 
Given the constant evolution of the media landscape, comprehensive 
efforts will be needed to ensure that all groups are benefiting equally 
from health messages on the internet. If not, the rise of new media may 
serve only to exacerbate already apparent disparities in health.
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