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The “International Conference on 12th World congress 
On Alzheimers Disease and Dementia” hosted by 
conference series with the theme, “Innovative 
approaches to defeat Alzheimers Disease and Dementia” 
was successfully executed during  March 20-21,2019 in 
Sydney, Australia. The conference offered a unique 
opportunity to investigators across the globe in order to 
meet, explore, network and perceive new scientific 
innovations. The conference received commendable and 
active participation was received from the Editorial 
Board Members of OMICS Group Journals as well as 
from the global scientists, Professors, Academicians, 
Researcher Scholars and students  from  diverse fields 
Alzheimers disease and Dementia. 

The conference commenced with the presence of 
worthy Keynote forum and among the notable ones, few 
are listed below. 

• Stress-induced Alzheimer’s disease, Gregory Yeh,
University of Michigan, USA.

• Single domain antibody fragments reverse cognitive
function deficits and amyloid plaques in alzheimer’s
disease animal models, Mourad Tayebi, Western Sydney
University, Australia.

Conference series is organizing “12th World Congress 
On Alzheimers Disease and Dementia” which is going to 
be held on January 23-24, 2020 at Bangkok, Thailand. 
The Theme of the conference is “Innovative approaches 
to defeat Alzheimers Disease and Dementia”. The 
conference is going to cover the entire field related to 
Brain Science, Psychiatry, Cognitive science latest 
research and findings . The Conference will provide a 
platform where research scholars and students will be 
able to gain knowledge about new, innovative research 
and findings from the eminent Scientist, Researchers 
and Professors.  
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The conference highlights of Alzheimers Congress 2020 
are as follows: neurological Disorders 

Alzheimers disease and Dementia, Vascular Dementia, 
Dementia with Lewy Bodies, Managing Dementia, 
Imaging Techniques, Pathophysiology and Disease 
Mechanism, Geriatric and Cognitive Disorder, Animal 
models and Translational Medicine, Current Research in 
Therapeutic Targets, Care Practice and Awareness, 
Behavioral Problems in Alzheimers disease, Insulin 
Resistance on the development of Alzheimers disesase, 
Neurological Diseases, Alzheimers Disease and Type 2 
Diabetes. 
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Program Manager:  Rosy Mary 

E: neuro@expert-meetings.com 

Contact No: +1-201-380-5561 

Whatsapp No: +44-203-7690-972 
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