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Conference Series LLC LTD proudly invites participants 
from all over the world to attend the “2nd International 
Conference on Metabolomics, Genomics and Proteomics” 
scheduled to be held in Singapore during March 28-29, 
2020. Metabolomics congress 2020 is a world-class 
conference which includes discussion and workshops, 
symposiums, B2B meetings, keynote speeches, young 
research forums, poster presentations, e-Poster 
introductions and a panel session on the most recent 
advancements and patterns in the field of metabolomics, 
genomics and proteomics. 

Metabolomics Congress 2020 goals to unite a great 
number of participants which include professors, PhD 
scholars, students, metabolomics and proteomics 
researchers, biochemist, genetics associations, 
pharmaceutical industrial giants, and business delegates 
from all over the world with the related topics to deliver a 
speech and share the current research ideas, strategies 
and connect with others in Singapore. 

Expert Level (Scientific Service Achievement Award) 

The award is to the experts in biochemistry, who have 
made outstanding contributions to advancing in 
metabolomics, genomics and proteomics. It is the most 
prestigious award of the conference and tagged as a 
Scientific Service Achievement award. The eligibility 
criteria for the award is one should have more than 20 
years of experience in the relative field in the public and 
private sector. The receiver of this award should have a 
dedicated fascination and should take initiative in 
researching the new strategies and emerging trends in 
metabolomics, genomics and proteomics area. You can 
nominate deserving of the award online. 

Professional Level (The Research Contribution Award) 

The award for professional or academic research activity 
acquired in metabolomics, genomics and proteomics 

research field in the public or private sector for experts 
having research knowledge of more than 10 years in the 
field of biochemistry with most relevant 
accomplishments. Part-time research experience will be 
considered as pro-rata, experience will be calculated from 
the date when you received your (first) degree which will 
give you the title to join doctorate (in the country from 
where you obtained the degree or any other foreign 
country), even if the doctorate was never started. You can 
nominate deserving of the award online. 

Scholar Level (The Upcoming Researcher Award) 

The conference offers Scholar Level award for the 
upcoming scientists, researchers, and experts having 
more than 10+ years of research experience in the field 
of metabolomics, genomics and proteomics. Our 
conference would like to provide the best platform to 
expand your network by sharing your research 
proficiency at the stage. The presentation includes 25-30 
minutes of oral talk on the scientific research topics based 
on the theme of the conference along with 5 minutes of 
panel discussions. You can nominate deserving of the 
award online. 

Women Scientist (The Women of Science Award) 

Our conference provides a unique platform for women 
scientists for presenting the latest biochemistry research 
projects with an in-depth analysis and expertness in the 
fields of metabolomics, genomics and proteomics. We 
cordially invite women scholars and scientists from 
universities/industries to have more than 10+ years of 
research experience to join the scientific forum. We are 
pleased to encourage our women scientist participants 
through research awards and provide assistance for 
women scholars in career development and research 
guidance through our collaborations. Women scientists 
can nominate deserving of the award online. 
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Outstanding speaker in Metabolomics Congress 2020 

This award is recognizing individuals who will present 
their knowledge through their projects, new strategies, 
and schemes that have been implemented to improve 
long-term excellence in metabolomics, genomics and 
proteomics. You can nominate deserving of the award 
online. 

Best Keynote Speaker in Metabolomics Congress 2020 

This award is recognized for the best Keynote speaker the 
one who will present project experiences with their 
excellence in Biochemistry. The expert who has 20 years 
of experience in the field of Metabolomics, Proteomics 
and Genomics and providing many aspects on the subject 
for the development is eligible for this award. 

Best Poster Presentation in Metabolomics Congress 2020 

We are glad to invite students for Poster Competition 
organized at the conference, to encourage students and 
recent graduates to present their original research. 
Conference Series aims at providing a platform for all the 

expert scientists and researchers to present their real-
time work and share their views and aspects related to 
the theme of the conference. You can nominate deserving 
of the award online. 

Outstanding Masters/Ph.D./Post Doctorate thesis work 
Presentation in Metabolomics Congress 2020 

This award acknowledges for Masters/Ph.D./Post-
doctorate, students who will exhibit their thesis work in 
unique and interesting style attracting international level 
attendees of the field Biochemistry (Metabolomics, 
Proteomics, Genomics) You can nominate deserving of 
the award online. 

Contact Person: 
With regards, 
Emily Wilson 
Program Manager | Metabolomics Congress 2020 
Send an email to: metabolomics@globalconferences.net  
Phone No.: +44 7723 584354 
WhatsApp No.: +61 4800 30912 
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